

Frankstown Township held a special meeting on May 10, 2019 at 1:00 PM to open the following bids:

Stone:

| | FOB Jobsite | FOB Plant |
|---------------------------------|---------------------------|---------------|
| New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co. | \$ 458,175.00 | \$ 358,655.00 |
| Grannas Brothers | 425,475.00 | 354,475.00 |
| Woodlawn Equipment | Lack of bidding all items | |
| Glenn O Hawbaker | Lack of bidding all items | |

A motion was made by James Grove second by George Henry awarding the stone contract to Grannas Brothers in the amount of \$ 425,475.00 FOB Jobsite and \$354,475.00 FOB Plant. The motion passed unanimously.

Line Painting

| | |
|-------------------|--------------|
| Midlantic Marking | \$ 31,363.20 |
|-------------------|--------------|

A motion was made by James Grove second by George Henry awarding the Line painting contract to Midlantic Marking in the amount of \$31,363.20. The motion passed unanimously.

Resurfacing

| | |
|---------------------------------|--------------|
| Glenn O Hawbaker | \$261,627.10 |
| New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co. | 279,706.50 |
| Grannas Brothers | 217,165.10 |

A motion was made by James Grove second by George Henry awarding the Paving Contract bid to Grannas Brothers in the amount of \$ 217,165.10. The motion passed unanimously.

Rock Salt

| | |
|---------------------|------------------|
| Homer Sleek & Sons. | \$102.75 per ton |
| Detroit Salt | 92.28 per ton |
| Morton Salt | No Bid |
| Eastern Salt Co. | No Bid |
| Compass Minerals | No Bid |
| American Rock Salt | No Bid |
| Cargil | No Bid |

A motion was made by George Henry and second by James Grove to award the salt contract to Detroit Salt in the amount of \$92.28 per ton, subject to clarification on the LLC vs Co. on the contract and bid bond. The motion passed unanimously.

With no other business brought before the Board of Supervisors the Board retired into an executive session for legal matters.

A motion was made by James Grove and 2nd by George Henry to adjourn the meeting at 2:00 PM. The motion passed unanimously.